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THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF YORK 
 
 

BYLAW NO. 2022-14 
 

A bylaw to designate parts of Regional roads  
as Community Safety Zones 

 
 

WHEREAS Section 214.1(1) of the Highway Traffic Act, R.S.O. 1990 c. H.8 

provides that the council of a municipality may by by-law designate a part of a highway 

under its jurisdiction as a Community Safety Zone if, in the council’s opinion, public safety 

is of special concern on that part of the highway; 

AND WHEREAS the Council of The Regional Municipality of York is of the opinion 

that public safety is of special concern on parts of certain highways forming the Regional 

road system; 

The Council of The Regional Municipality of York hereby enacts as follows: 

 
1. That part of the highway in Column 1 between the limits set out in Column 2 is 

hereby designated as a Community Safety Zone during the times set out in Column 

3. The facilities set out in Column 4 are for reference purposes only. 

 

Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

TOWN OF AURORA 

Yonge Street 
(Y.R. 1) 

From the north limit of St. John’s 
Sideroad (Y.R. 26) to 190 
metres north of the north limit of 
Orchard Heights Boulevard 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

St. Andrew’s College 
 
The Lighthouse 
Learning and 
Development Centre 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Wellington 
Street East 
/Wellington 
Street West 
(Y.R. 15) 
 

From 800 metres east of the 
east limit of Bathurst Street 
(Y.R. 38) to 520 metres west of 
the west limit of Bayview 
Avenue (Y.R. 34) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Aurora High School 
 
Aurora Senior Public 
School 
 
St Maximilian Kolbe 
Catholic High School 
 

Bayview 
Avenue  
(Y.R. 34) 

From 200 metres south of the 
south limit of Wellington Street 
(Y.R. 15) to 410 metres south 
thereof 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

La Maison 
Montessori House 

Bathurst 
Street 
(Y.R. 38)1 

From 210 metres south of the 
south limit of Bloomington Road 
(Y.R. 40) to 450 metres north of 
the north limit of Bloomington 
Road (Y.R. 40) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

École Secondaire 
Catholique 
Renaissance 
 
 

Bloomington 
Road 
(Y.R. 40)2 

From 145 metres west of the 
west limit of Bathurst Street 
(Y.R. 38) to 225 metres west of 
the west limit of Yonge Street 
(Y.R. 1) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

École Secondaire 
Catholique 
Renaissance 
 
Cardinal Carter 
Catholic High School 
 

TOWN OF EAST GWILLIMBURY 

Leslie Street 
(Y.R. 12) 

From 390 metres north of the 
north limit of Queensville 
Sideroad (Y.R. 77) to 830 
metres north of the north limit of 
Queensville Sideroad (Y.R. 77) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Queensville 
Montessori Academy 

Leslie Street 
(Y.R. 12) 

From 210 metres south of the 
south limit of Queensville 
Sideroad (Y.R. 77) to 730 
metres south of the south limit of 
Queensville Sideroad (Y.R. 77) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Queensville Public 
School 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Leslie Street 
(Y.R. 12) 

From 500 metres north of the 
north limit of Green Lane (Y.R. 
19) to 900 metres north of the 
north limit of Green Lane (Y.R. 
19) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Sharon Public School 

Mount Albert 
Road 
(Y.R. 13) 

From 1210 metres west of the 
west limit of 2nd Concession 
Road (Y.R. 34) to 80 metres 
east of the east limit of 2nd  
Concession Road (Y.R. 34)  

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Good Shepherd 
Catholic Elementary 
School 
 
Holland Landing 
Public School 
 

Mount Albert 
Road 
(Y.R. 13) 

From 500 metres east of the 
east limit of Highway 48 to 1340 
metres east of the east limit of 
Highway 48 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Mount Albert Public 
School 

2nd 
Concession 
Road 
(Y.R. 34) 

From 595 metres north of the 
north limit of Mount Albert Road 
(Y.R. 13) to 450 metres south of 
the south limit of Mount Albert 
Road (Y.R. 13) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Good Shepherd 
Catholic Elementary 
School 
 
École Elementaire 
Catholique Jean-
Béliveau 
 

Bathurst 
Street  
(Y.R. 38)3 

From the south limit of Bathurst 
Street to 525 metres south of 
the south limit of Graham 
Sideroad 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

King Christian School 

TOWN OF GEORGINA 

Baseline Road 
(Y.R. 8A) 

From 750 metres west of the 
west limit of Dalton Road (Y.R. 
9) to the west limit of Dalton 
Road (Y.R. 9) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Sutton Public School 
 
Sutton District High 
School 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Glenwoods 
Avenue 
(Y.R. 33) 

From the east limit of The 
Queensway (Y.R. 12) to 830 
metres east of the east limit of 
The Queensway (Y.R. 12) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Prince of Peace 
Children's Centre 
 
Our Lady of the Lake 
Catholic College 
School 
 
Jersey Public School 
 

Old 
Homestead 
Road 
(Y.R. 79) 

From the east limit of Metro 
Road (Y.R. 78) to 375 metres 
east of the east limit of Metro 
Road (Y.R. 78) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

St. Thomas Aquinas 
Catholic Elementary 
School 

TOWNSHIP OF KING 

King Road 
(Y.R. 11) 

From the west limit of Keele 
Street (Y.R. 6) to 45 metres east 
of the east limit of Warren Road 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

King City Secondary 
School 

Lloydtown/ 
Aurora Road 
(Y.R. 16) 

From 450 metres west of the 
west limit of Jane Street (Y.R. 
55) to 1050 metres west of the 
west limit of Jane Street (Y.R. 
55) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Kettleby Public 
School 

Highway 27 
(Y.R. 27) 

From 470 metres north of the 
north limit of Lloydtown-Aurora 
Road (Y.R. 16) to 1055 metres 
north of the north limit of 
Lloydtown-Aurora Road (Y.R. 
16) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Schomberg Public 
School 

Highway 27 
(Y.R. 27) 

From 570 metres north of the 
north limit of King Road (Y.R. 
11) to 1160 metres north of the 
north limit of King Road (Y.R. 
11) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Nobleton Senior 
Public School 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Bathurst 
Street  
(Y.R. 38)3 

From the south limit of Bathurst 
Street to 525 metres south of 
the south limit of Graham 
Sideroad 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

King Christian School 

Bathurst 
Street 

(Y.R. 38)1 

From 210 metres south of the 
south limit of Bloomington Road 
(Y.R. 40) to 450 metres north of 
the north limit of Bloomington 
Road (Y.R. 40) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

École Secondaire 
Catholique 
Renaissance 
 
 

Bloomington 
Road 
(Y.R. 40)2 

From 145 metres west of the 
west limit of Bathurst Street 
(Y.R. 38) to 225 metres west of 
the west limit of Yonge Street 
(Y.R. 1) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

École Secondaire 
Catholique 
Renaissance 
 
Cardinal Carter 
Catholic High School 
 

Dufferin Street 
(Y.R. 53) 

From 660 metres north of the 
north limit of King Road (Y.R. 
11) to 1500 metres north of the 
north limit of King Road (Y.R. 
11) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

The Country Day 
School 

CITY OF MARKHAM 

Yonge Street  
(Y.R. 1)4 

From 95 metres south of the 
south limit of John Street to 120 
metres north of the north limit of 
Clark Avenue 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Thornhill Public 
School 

Kennedy 
Road 
(Y.R. 3) 

From 300 metres south of the 
south limit of 14th Avenue to the 
north limit of Denison Street 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Milliken Mills High 
School 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Kennedy 
Road 
(Y.R. 3) 

From 750 metres south of the 
south limit of 16th Avenue (Y.R. 
73) to 450 metres north of the 
north limit of 16th Avenue (Y.R. 
73) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Unionville Montessori 
School 
 
Unionville Public 
School 
 

Highway 7 
(Y.R. 7) 

From 100 metres west of 
Conservation Avenue/Laidlaw 
Boulevard to 100 metres east of 
Grandview Boulevard/ 
Galsworthy Drive 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

St. Patrick Catholic 
Elementary School 

Woodbine 
Avenue 
(Y.R. 8) 

From 150 metres north of the 
north limit of Russell Dawson 
Road to 500 metres south of the 
south limit of Russell Dawson 
Road 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Sir John A. 
Macdonald Public 
School 

Leslie Street 
(Y.R. 12) 

From 860 metres south of the 
south limit of Highway 7 (Y.R. 7) 
to 1405 metres south of the 
south limit of Highway 7 (Y.R. 7) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

St. Robert Catholic 
High School 

Bayview 
Avenue 
(Y.R. 34)5 

From the south limit of Thornlea 
Road to 430 metres north of the 
north limit of Highway 7 (Y.R. 7) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Thornlea Secondary 
School 
 
Toronto Montessori 
Schools 

Warden 
Avenue 
(Y.R. 65) 

From the north limit of Highway 
7 (Y.R. 7) to 700 metres north of 
the north limit of Highway 7 
(Y.R. 7) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Unionville High 
School 

McCowan 
Road 
(Y.R. 67) 

From 480 metres south of the 
south limit of 16th Avenue (Y.R. 
73) to 1100 metres south of the 
south limit of 16th Avenue (Y.R. 
73) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Markville Secondary 
School 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

McCowan 
Road 
(Y.R. 67) 

From 150 metres south of the 
south limit of 14th Avenue (Y.R. 
71) to 500 metres north of the 
north limit of 14th Avenue (Y.R. 
71) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Father Michael 
McGivney Academy 
Catholic High School 

14th Avenue 
(Y.R. 71) 

From 150 metres west of the 
west limit of McCowan Road 
(Y.R. 67) to 375 metres east of 
the east limit of McCowan Road 
(Y.R. 67) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Father Michael 
McGivney Academy 
Catholic High School 

14th Avenue 
(Y.R. 71) 

From 360 metres west of the 
west limit of Kennedy Road 
(Y.R. 3) to 980 metres west of 
the west limit of Kennedy Road 
(Y.R. 3) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Trillium School 

16th Avenue 
(Y.R. 73) 

From 60 metres east of the east 
limit of Markham Road to 795 
metres east of the east limit of 
Markham Road 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

St. Brother Andre 
Catholic High School 

16th Avenue 
(Y.R. 73) 

From 360 metres west of the 
west limit of Kennedy Road 
(Y.R. 3) to 215 metres east of 
the east limit of Kennedy Road 
(Y.R. 3) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Unionville Montessori 
School 

TOWN OF NEWMARKET 

Davis Drive  
(Y.R. 31) 

From 450 metres east of the 
east limit of Prospect Street 
(Y.R. 34) to 950 metres west of 
the west limit of Leslie Street 
(Y.R. 12) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Huron Heights 
Secondary School 

Bayview 
Avenue/ 
Prospect 
Street 
(Y.R. 34) 

From 155 metres north of the 
north limit of Mulock Drive (Y.R. 
74) to 1000 metres north of the 
north limit of Mulock Drive (Y.R. 
74) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Pickering College 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Bathurst 
Street  
(Y.R. 38) 

From 500 metres north of the 
north limit of Mulock Drive (Y.R. 
74) to 950 metres north of the 
north limit of Mulock Drive (Y.R. 
74) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

St. Nicholas Catholic 
Elementary School 

Mulock Drive  
(Y.R. 74) 

From 240 metres west of the 
west limit of Leslie Street (Y.R. 
12) to 950 metres west of the 
west limit of Leslie Street (Y.R. 
12) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Newmarket High 
School 

CITY OF RICHMOND HILL 

Yonge Street 
(Y.R. 1) 

From 95 metres north of the 
north limit of Blackforest Drive to 
95 metres south of the south 
limit of Ashfield Drive 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Dr. Bette Stephenson 
Centre for Learning 
 
Académie de la 
Moraine 

Yonge Street 
(Y.R. 1) 

From 450 metres north of the 
north limit of 16th Avenue (Y.R. 
73) to 950 metres north of the 
north limit of 16th Avenue (Y.R. 
73) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Easy Learning Path 

Yonge Street 
(Y.R. 1) 

From the north limit of 19th 
Avenue (Y.R. 29) to 390 meters 
north of the north limit of 19th 
Avenue (Y.R. 29) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Richland Academy 

Leslie Street  
(Y.R. 12) 

From 70 metres north of the 
north limit of Elgin Mills Road 
East (Y.R. 49) to 735 metres 
north of the north limit of Elgin 
Mills Road East (Y.R. 49) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Richmond Green 
Secondary School 

http://maps.google.com/maps/place?cid=6259939104442191515&q=st+nicholas+school+newmarket&hl=en&ved=0CBMQ-gswAA&sa=X&ei=jwFQT4egH5WsNt-b-LAH
http://maps.google.com/maps/place?cid=6259939104442191515&q=st+nicholas+school+newmarket&hl=en&ved=0CBMQ-gswAA&sa=X&ei=jwFQT4egH5WsNt-b-LAH
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Major 
Mackenzie 
Drive East 
/Major 
Mackenzie 
Drive West 
(Y.R. 25) 
 

From 220 metres west of the 
west limit of Trench St to the 
west limit of Colborne Avenue 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Alexander Mackenzie 
High School 
 
Walter Scott Public 
School 
 

Bayview 
Avenue  
(Y.R. 34) 

From 1070 metres south of the 
south limit of Major Mackenzie 
Drive East (Y.R. 25) to 155 
metres south of the south limit of 
19th Avenue (Y.R. 29) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Bayview Secondary 
School 
 
Jean Vanier Catholic 
High School 
 
Richmond Hill 
Christian Academy 
 
Holy Trinity School 
 

Bayview 
Avenue  
(Y.R. 34)5 

From the south limit of Thornlea 
Road to 430 metres north of the 
north limit of Highway 7 (Y.R. 7) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Thornlea Secondary 
School 
 
Toronto Montessori 
Schools 

Bathurst 
Street  
(Y.R. 38)6 

From 950 metres north of the 
north limit of Rutherford 
Road/Carrville Road (Y.R. 73) to 
760 metres south of the south 
limit of Rutherford 
Road/Carrville Road (Y.R. 73) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Kimel Family 
Education Centre 
 
Toronto Waldorf 
School 
 
 

Bathurst 
Street 
(Y.R. 38)1 

From 210 metres south of the 
south limit of Bloomington Road 
(Y.R. 40) to 450 metres north of 
the north limit of Bloomington 
Road (Y.R. 40) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

École Secondaire 
Catholique 
Renaissance 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Bloomington 
Road 
(Y.R. 40)2 

From 145 metres west of the 
west limit of Bathurst Street 
(Y.R. 38) to 225 metres west of 
the west limit of Yonge Street 
(Y.R. 1) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

École Secondaire 
Catholique 
Renaissance 
 
Cardinal Carter 
Catholic High School 
 

16th Avenue/ 
Carrville Road 
(Y.R. 73) 

From 550 metres east of the 
east limit of Bathurst Street 
(Y.R. 38) to 315 metres west of 
the west limit of Bayview 
Avenue (Y.R. 34)  

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

16th Avenue Public 
School 
 
Roselawn Public 
School 
 
Global Montessori 
Day Nursery & 
Private Elementary 
School 
 

16th Avenue 
(Y.R. 73) 

From 45 metres east of the east 
limit of Leslie Street (Y.R. 12) to 
350 metres east of the east limit 
of Leslie Street (Y.R. 12) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Grade Learning 

CITY OF VAUGHAN 

Yonge Street  
(Y.R. 1)4 

From 95 metres south of the 
south limit of John Street to 120 
metres north of the north limit of 
Clark Avenue 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Thornhill Public 
School 

Keele Street 
(Y.R. 6) 

From 135 metres north of the 
north limit of Rutherford Road 
(Y.R. 73) to 60 metres north of  
the north limit of Cromwell Road 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Father John Kelly 
Elementary School 

Islington 
Avenue  
(Y.R. 17) 

From 300 metres south of the 
south limit of Rutherford Road 
(Y.R. 73) to 300 metres north of 
the north limit of Rutherford 
Road (Y.R. 73) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Al Palladini 
Community Centre 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

Major 
Mackenzie 
Drive  
(Y.R. 25) 

From 310 metres west of the 
west limit of Weston Road (Y.R. 
56) to the west limit of Vellore 
Avenue 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Tommy Douglas 
Secondary School 

Bathurst 
Street  
(Y.R. 38) 

From 70 metres north of the 
north limit of Steeles Avenue to 
500 metres north of the north 
limit of Steeles Avenue 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

The Joe Dwek Ohr 
Haemet Sephardic 
School 

Bathurst 
Street  
(Y.R. 38)6 

From 950 metres north of the 
north limit of Rutherford 
Road/Carrville Road (Y.R. 73) to 
760 metres south of the south 
limit of Rutherford 
Road/Carrville Road (Y.R. 73) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Kimel Family 
Education Centre 
 
Toronto Waldorf 
School 
 
 

Bathurst 
Street  
(Y.R. 38) 

From 140 metres south of the 
south limit of Atkinson Avenue 
to the south limit of Flamingo 
Road 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Westmount 
Collegiate Institute 
 

Weston Road  
(Y.R. 56) 

From 170 metres north of the 
north limit of Villa Royal Avenue 
to 155 metres south of the south 
limit of Davos Road 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

St. Jean de Brébeuf 
Catholic High School 

Weston Road 
(Y.R. 56) 

From the north limit of Rowntree 
Dairy Road to the north limit of 
Chrislea Road 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

 

Rutherford 
Road  
(Y.R. 73) 

From the west limit of Islington 
Avenue (Y.R. 17) to 800 metres 
east of the west limit of Islington 
Avenue (Y.R. 17)  
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Emily Carr 
Secondary School 
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Column 1 
(Highway) 
 

Column 2 
(Description of Part of Highway) 

Column 3 
(Hours) 

Column 4 
(Schools/Centres) 

TOWN OF WHITCHURCH - STOUFFVILLE 

Aurora Road 
(Y.R. 15) 

From 585 metres east of the 
east limit of Highway 48 to 1330 
metres east of the east limit of 
Highway 48 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Ballantrae Public 
School 

Bloomington 
Road   
(Y.R. 40) 

From 445 metres west of the 
west limit of Warden Avenue 
(Y.R. 65) to 230 metres east of 
the east limit of Warden Avenue 
(Y.R. 65) 
 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Whitchurch 
Highlands Public 
School 

Warden 
Avenue  
(Y.R. 65) 

From 475 metres north of the 
north limit of Bloomington Road 
(Y.R. 40) to 140 metres south of 
the south limit of Bloomington 
Road (Y.R. 40) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

Whitchurch 
Highlands Public 
School 

Ninth Line 
(Y.R. 69) 

From 355 metres north of the 
north limit of Hoover Park Drive 
to 155 metres south of the south 
limit of Hoover Park Drive  

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 
 

St. Brendan Catholic 
Elementary School 

Ninth Line 
(Y.R. 69) 

From 75 metres north of the 
north limit of Stouffville Road 
(Y.R. 14) to 890 metres north of 
the north limit of Stouffville Road 
(Y.R. 14) 

24 hours per 
day/7 days 
per week 
throughout 
the year 

Glad Park Public 
School 

 
Table notes: 
1 Location exists in Town of Aurora, Township of King and City of Richmond Hill. 
2 Location exists in Town of Aurora, Township of King and City of Richmond Hill. 
3 Location exists in Town of East Gwillimbury and Township of King. 
4 Location exists in City of Markham and City of Vaughan. 
5 Location exists in City of Markham and City of Richmond Hill. 
6 Location exists in City of Richmond Hill and City of Vaughan. 

 
2. Bylaw Nos. R-1195-1999-077, R-1195(a)-2004-061, 2012-50, 2012-52, 2013-36, 
 2014-42 and 2018-49 are hereby repealed. 
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ENACTED AND PASSED on March 24, 2022.  

 

   

Regional Clerk  Regional Chair 
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